

**IFB #18-0013 CHEMICAL TABULATIONS
JUNE 19, 2018 AT 3:30 P.M.**

Name of Company	Hydrated Lime	Chlorine Gas	Sulfur Dioxide	Sodium Chlorite	Aluminum Sulfate	Sodium Fluorosilicate
Allied Universal Corporation	No Bid	\$0.257 lb	\$0.355 lb	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
C&S Chemicals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.575 gal	No Bid
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.6456 gal	No Bid
TSM Enterprises Group Inc	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.99 lb	No Bid	No Bid
GEO Specialty Chemicals	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.77 gal P1 \$1.22 gal P2	No Bid
Brenntag Mid-South	\$0.19 lb	\$0.281 lb	\$0.519 lb	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.64 lb
Harcros Chemicals	\$0.155 P1 \$0.155 P2 \$0.125 Waste	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Affinity Chemical LLC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	0.524 gal	No Bid
Sterling Water Technologies LLC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Chemrite Inc	\$0.1675 bag \$0.1039 bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.57 lb
Industrial Chemicals Inc	\$0.16 bag \$0.1125 bulk	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
AWARDS:	Harcros - WP 1 & 2 Chemrite - Waste	Allied	Allied	TSM	Affinity	Chemrite

Jacque Huley, CPPB

This signature verifies that Bid(s) were opened and read aloud.

NAME
Jacque Huley
Jeanette Crawford
Starlotte S. Holgreen

City of Milledgeville
City of Milledgeville